PUBLIC HEARING OF THE TANGIPAHOA PARISH COUNCIL ON TUESDAY, DECEMBER 27, 2016 AT
5:30 P.M. AT THE TANGIPAHOA PARISH GOVERNMENT BUILDING, 206 EAST MULBERRY STREET,
AMITE, LOUISIANA —

T.P. Ordinance No. 16-65- An ordinance authorizing the Parish President to execute any and all documents in regards to an
agreement with Southern Aggregate, LLC in regards to mine or cause property to be mined for aggregates at the Tangipahoa
Parish Landfill

T.P. Ordinance No. 16-66- An ordinance placing Closed to Thru Traffic Between 11:30AM & 1:30PM during school hours on
Hyatt Road in front of Loranger High School in District No. 4 in Tangipahoa Parish in accordance with Chapter 20, Streets,
Roads, Sidewalks and Drainage- Article I, in General- Section 20-16

No one from the public wished to address any of the foregoing items. The following were read by Mr. Cortez:

MINUTES OF THE TANGIPAHOA PARISH COUNCIL
December 27, 2016

The Tangipahoa Parish Council met on the 27" day of December, 2016 in Regular Session and was called to order by
Mr. Bobby Cortez, Chairman, immediately following the public hearing held at 5:30 P.M.
The Invocation was given by Mr. David Vial and the Pledge of Allegiance by Mr. Buddy Ridgel

The following members were present: Trent Forrest, James Bailey, Carlo Bruno, Buddy Ridgel, David Vial, Harry Lavine
and Bobby Cortez
Absent: Joseph, Mayeaux, Wells

Item No. 5 - Cell Phones - Please Mute or Turn Off.

Item No. 6 - Adoption of Minutes - A motion was made by Mr. Bailey and seconded by Mr. Vial to adopt the minutes of the
regular meeting dated December 12, 2016 and requesting that they be dispensed and published in the Official Journal.
Roll-call vote was as follows:

Yeas: 7 (Forrest, Bailey, Bruno, Ridgel, Vial, Lavine, Cortez)

Nays: None

Abstain: None

Absent: 3 (Joseph, Mayeaux, Wells)

Not Voting: None

Item No. 7 - Public Input - Anyone Wishing to Address Agenda Items which were not on Public Hearing -
None

Item No. 8- Parish President's Report
a) Approval to Purchase Vehicles- Code Enforcement- A motion was made by Mr. Vial and
seconded by Mr. Bailey to approve the purchase of two Dodge Ram 1500’s from Courtesy Dodge off of
state contract for a price of $18,308.75. Roll call vote was as follows:
Yeas: 7 (Forrest, Bailey, Bruno, Ridgel, Vial, Lavine, Cortez)
Nays: None
Abstain: None
Absent: 3 (Joseph, Mayeaux, Wells)
Not Voting: None
b) Approval to Seek Bids- Scalehouse Improvements- A motion was made by Mr. Forrest and
seconded by Mr. Ridgel fiving approval to seek bids for scalehouse improvements. Roll call vote was as
follows:
Yeas: 7 (Forrest, Bailey, Bruno, Ridgel, Vial, Lavine, Cortez)
Nays: None
Abstain: None
Absent: 3 (Joseph, Mayeaux, Wells)
Not Voting: None
c) Approval of Change Orders-

1) Change Order No. 2- Port Manchac Improvements- A motion was made by Mr. Forrest
and seconded by Mr. Vial to approve change order no. 2 for Port Manchac improvements in the amount of -
$31815.50. Roll call vote was as follows:

Yeas: 7 (Forrest, Bailey, Bruno, Ridgel, Vial, Lavine, Cortez)
Nays: None

Abstain: None

Absent: 3 (Joseph, Mayeaux, Wells)

Not Voting: None

2) Change Order No. 1. Hazard Mitigation Grant Program Ponchatoula City Hall- A motion
was made by Mr. Lavine and seconded by Mr. Vial to approval change order no. 1 for the Hazard
Mitigation Grant Program Ponchatoula City Hall increasing the contract days by 91 days. Roll call vote
was as follows:

Yeas: 7 (Forrest, Bailey, Bruno, Ridgel, Vial, Lavine, Cortez)
Nays: None

Abstain: None

Absent: 3 (Joseph, Mayeaux, Wells)

Not Voting: None

3) Change Order No. 2- Walsh Road Bridge Repair- A motion was made by Mr. Bruno and
seconded by Mr. Vial to approve change order no. 2 for Walsh Road bridge repairs adding the sum of




$24,400 to the total. Roll call vote was as follows:

Yeas: 7 (Forrest, Bailey, Bruno, Ridgel, Vial, Lavine, Cortez)
Nays: None

Abstain: None

Absent: 3 (Joseph, Mayeaux, Wells)

Not Voting: None

4) Change Order No. 2- Stein Road Bridge Repair- A motion was made by Mr. Bailey and
seconded by Mr. Bruno to approve change order no. 2 for Stein Road bridge repairs adding the sum of

$24,400 to the total. Roll call vote was as follows:

Yeas: 7 (Forrest, Bailey, Bruno, Ridgel, Vial, Lavine, Cortez)
Nays: None

Abstain: None

Absent: 3 (Joseph, Mayeaux, Wells)

Not Voting: None

d) Approval of Substantial Completion- Ponchatoula City Hall- A motion was made by Mr. Vial and
seconded by Mr. Bailey to approve substantial completion of Ponchatoula City Hall Hazard Mitigation

Grant Program project. Roll call vote was as follows:

Yeas: 7 (Forrest, Bailey, Bruno, Ridgel, Vial, Lavine, Cortez)

Nays: None

Abstain: None

Absent: 3 (Joseph, Mayeaux, Wells)

Not Voting: None

e) Approval of End of Year Bids- End of year bids were presented as follows:
BRIDGE MATERIAL

Bayou Forest

Curbs & Bridge Rails Products

LENGTH
DIAMETER

20° 32.54
2°X8”

20° 44.00
47X6”
67X6” 20’ 66.60
37X8” 20’ 44.40
Deck Board

LENGTH
Diameter
37X8” 22’ 53.68

24° 58.80
37X8”

26’ 66.56
37X8”

24° 75.00
37X10”
37X10” 26’ 84.83
37X12” 24’ 92.16

26’ 104.13
37X12”
STRINGERS

LENGTH
DIAMETER
67X12” 20’ 146.40
67X12” 22’ 164.34

24’ 186.48
67X12”

20° 178.50
67X14”
67X14” 22’ 204.05

24’ 231.00
67X14”

26’ 259.35
67X14”
67X14” 28’ 284.20
CAPS

LENGTH
DIAMETER

24’ 250.00




107X10”
26° 295.75
107X10”
12°X12" 24 384.48
12°X12" 26’ 433.68
28’ 487.20
127X12”
PILING
DIAMETER L ENGTH
12”/3” (PER LINEAR FOOT) 25 225.00
127/3” (PER LINEAR FOOT) 30° 252.00
127/3” (PER LINEAR FOOT) 35’ 278.25
127/3” (PER LINEAR FOOT) 40° 302.00
127/3” (PER LINEAR FOOT) 50° 385.00
COLD MIX BID
COLD MIX BARRIERE MATERIAL RJ DAIGLE & SONS
Type D Mixture CONSTRUCTION RESOURCES CONTRACTORS
$84.25 PER TON $94.50 PER TON NO BID/ 93.20 PER TON
COLD ASPHALT
Fuel Bids E&S RETIF RETIF
Rosela | D/B/A || arp | O & | Langfil | E&S | LarD |oiL& | Plesant | peq RETIF
PURE FUEL PURE Ridge LARD
nd shop | o oIL | oI oIL FUEL | oo PURE | o OIL &
P 1o FUEL
EST EST EST
QUAN QUAN QUAN
TILTY TITY TITY
REG GAS N
2000 | seo0 | 2050 | 440 2000 | .2500 | .2950 | .449 4000 | 2450 | 29050 | .449
ON
*
ROAD 2000% | ,eg | 2950 | g 800 2500 | 3250 | .449 4000 | 2450 | 2950 | .449
DIESEL
OFF
*
ROAD 4000* | e00 | o750 | 059 8000 | .0500 |.0759 | .049 4000 | .0450 | .0759 | .059
DIESLE
HOT MIX DIAMOND B BARRIERE CONSTRUCTION

F.O0.B. PARISH TRUCKS (ton)

58.00 PER TON

58.00 PER TON




Corrugated Metal Coastal Culvert & Contech Construction HD SUPPLY Building Specialties
Pipe Supply, Inc. WATERWORKS Com
22/37x1/2”
P C A P C A P C A P C A
127 16 |[8.65 10.97|9.47 |590 [848 |762 |315 883 |7.93 990 |10.97 |10.65
15” 16 |10.35 (13.81 |11.36 |8.17 10.96 [10.36 |8.51 11.41 [10.79 |[12.31 |13.67 |13.20
17°X13” ARCH 16 [11.94 (1424 |13.13 |8.87 11.26 (10.87 |9.23 11,72 [(11.32 |13.54 |15.01 |14.52
18” 16 |12.64 (17.32 |1422 |10.35 [13.14 (1294 |10.78 |13.68 |[13.47 |[14.23 |15.79 |15.27
21”X15” ARCH 16 |[14.93 |19.47 |16.34 [11.22 (1421 |14.17 |11.68 [14.80 |1476 |15.69 |17.37 |[16.80
217 16 |1470 [19.76 |16.16 |11.26 |[14.87 |1460 |11.72 |15.48 (1520 [16.49 |18.29 |17.69
24” 16 |16.44 (2221 |18.08 |13.73 [17.60 |[17.50 |14.30 |18.33 [18.22 |[18.82 |20.88 |20.19
28”X20” ARCH 16 |18.89 |24.67 |20.38 |13.82 [18.96 |17.64 |14.39 |19.75 |18.37 |20.99 |22.99 |22.29
30” 14 [2591 |33.00 [28.06 |20.06 |[25.17 |26.89 [20.89 |26.21 [28.00 |28.77 |[31.92 |30.87
35”x24’ARCH 14 ([29.84 |37.00 [32.78 |20.68 [25.30 |27.83 [21.54 |26.35 [28.95 |31.65 [35.10 |33.95
36” 14 [31.04 |38.12 (34.23 |23.80 [28.33 |29.07 [24.79 |29.50 [30.28 |34.22 [38.18 |36.93
427 14 |[41.21 |51.84 (4591 |27.73 |[34.82 |34.32 (28.85 |36.25 |[35.72 |40.09 |(44.46 |43.10
427x29” ARCH 14 |35.16 [45.29 |38.64 |24.64 [36.34 |30.08 |25.66 |37.85 |31.32 |37.87 |42.10 |40.63
48’ 14 |48.78 |60.47 |52.95 (315 |41.74 |38.60 |32.80 (43.47 |40.20 |45.73 |50.73 |[49.09
497x33” ARCH 14 |44.02 [53.89 |52.69 |29.14 [37.35 [3455 |30.35 |38.90 [54.30 |(44.08 |48.90 |47.29
57°x38” ARCH 14 [77.76 |88.74 |84.17 |4551 |[50.53 |52.16 |47.40 |52.60 [59.15 |57.12 |63.36 |61.28
54” 12 |75.84 [90.87 |8253 |49.25 [56.13 [56.81 |51.30 |58.45 |[65.00 |62.37 |69.18 |66.93
60” 12 |83.01 [98.16 |90.86 |54.67 |65.82 [62.42 |56.90 |68.50 69.29 |79.83 |[74.30
Corrugated Metal
Pipe
3”x1” Corrugations | P C A P C A P C A P C A
66” 12 [107.44 |1129.47 [{119.35|83.87 [93.16 |98.22 [87.35 |97.00 |[102.27 |79.77 |88.49 |85.57
727 10 |149.84 |174.98 | 165.87 | 113.58 | 128.85 | 133.30 | 118.30 | 134.20 | 138.80 | 142.23 | 126.69 | 122.53
84” 10 [174.89 [207.11 |193.84 | 132.30 | 149.58 | 154.72 | 137.80 | 155.70 | 161.10 | 132.93 | 147.23 | 142.59
90” 10 |187.11 [217.64 | 206.12 | 141.66 | 155.33 | 167.55 | 147.50 | 161.70 | 174.45 | 142.29 | 157.89 | 152.63
96” 10 |199.24 [234.68 | 221.22 | 151.01 | 176.87 [177.73 | 157.20 | 184.10 | 185.00 | 151.63 | 169.69 | 163.69
ITEM1 GLASS CLEANER PER
12/32 WINDEX OR CASE
EQUIVALENT 15.34
ITEM 2 AIR FRESHENER 12/20 | PER 21.74
0z CASE
ITEM 3 SPRAY PER
DISINFECTANT 12/20 CASE 95 97
OZ LYSOL OR '
EQUIVALENT
ITEM 4 38X58 12 MIC TRASH
INTERPLAST OR 16.56 17.18/200 17
EQUIVALENT 19.82/200 | 17.18/200 17.18/200 18/200
ITEM5 FURNITURE POLISH PER
12/20 OZ PLEDGE OR CASE 21.56
EQUIVALENT
ITEM 6 QUICK STRIP BASE PER
BOARD STRIPPER CASE 24.49
12/200Z
ITEM7 WASP & HORNET PER 3500
KILLER 12/20 OZ CASE '
ITEM 8 IVORY SOAP BAR PK PER 98.50
72/3.1 CASE '
ITEM9 BLEACH 6/1 GALLON PER 780
CASE :
ITEM 10 BRAWNY DYNAMAX PER
WIPER 13.24 PK 150 OR | CASE 21.21
EQUIVALENT
ITEM 11 LYSOL PER
DISINFECTANT GAL 4.20
CLEANER GALLON
ITEM 12 | ALL PURPOSE PER 594
CLEANER 5 GALLON GAL '
ITEM 13 PINE DISINFECTANT PER 4.40
5 GALLON GAL '
2
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ITEM 14 | URINAL BLOCK WITH | PER 1178
SCREEN DOZEN DOZ '
ITEM 15 | WAREHOUSE EACH |, g
BROOMS EACH '
ITEM 16 | CARPET FRESHENERS | PER 26.20
6/2 LBS CASE :
ITEM 17 | COMET CLEANSER PER 15,03
24/21 0Z CASE '
ITEM 18 | 20° 3M CHAMPAGNE | PER 15,03
PADS PACK 5 CASE '
ITEM19 | 3M DOODLE BUG PER 5 09
STRIP PADS PACK 5 CASE '
ITEM20 | 19” 3M CHAMPAGNE | PER 13.29
PADS PACK 5 CASE '
ITEM 21 | 20” 3M RED PADS PER 1045
PACK 5 CASE '
ITEM 22 | 20” 3M GORILLA HAIR | PER 1367
PAD PACK 5 CASE '
ITEM 23 | 20" 3M WHITE PER 1045
POLISH PADS PACK 5 | CASE '
ITEM 24 | HOTEL SIZE BRILLO | PER 19.98
SOAP PADS 12/10 PK | CASE :
ITEM 25 | JAMES RIVER BATH | PER 24.80
TISSUE 2 JPLY 96 CASE
ROLLS 500 SHEET OR
EQUIVALENT
ITEM 26 | WISCONSIN JUMBO PER 19.43
BATH TISSUE 6/ROLL | CASE
EQUIVALENT
ITEM 27 | WISCONSIN KITCHEN | PER 16.00
ROLL TOWELS 30/100 | CASE
ROLL OR
EQUIVALENT
ITEM 28 | 24X33 MICRON 06 PER 15.04 15.82/1000 15.82/1000 | 15.82/1000 | 15.82/1000
TRASH BAGS PACK CASE 15.82/1000
1000/CS INTERPLAST
OR EQUIVALENT
ITEM29 | 30X37 TRASH BAGS PER 13.99 19.82/500 | 17.48/500 | 17.48/500 | 17.48/500 | 17.48/500
MICRON 10 TRASH CASE
BAGS PACK 500/CS
INTERPLAST OR
EQUIVALENT
ITEM 30 | 38X58 MICRON 1.5MIL | PER 18.04 24.98/100 | 21.72/100 | 19.98/100 | 15.84/100 | 15.84/100
TRASH BAGS PACK CASE
100/CS INTERPLAST
OR EQUIVALENT
ITEM 31 | 40X46 TRASH MICRON | PER 10.00 17.82/100 | 15.34/100 | 13.84/100 | 11.84/100 | 10.82/100
EX-HVY TRASH BAGS | CASE
100/CS INTERPLAST
OR EQUIVALENT
ITEM 32 | 38X58 4 MILEX-HVY | PER 44.60 48.84/100 | 42.98/100 | 34.82/100 | 28.34/100 | 23.34/100
TRASH BAGS 100/CS | CASE
INTERPLAST OR
EQUIVALENT
ITEM 33 | FINISH MOP HEAD PER 56.39
LARGE BLUE/WHITE | CASE
WILEN OR
EQUIVALENT
ITEM 34 | GENERAL PER 37.57
MAINTENANCE MOP | CASE
HEAD BLUEMED.
WILEN OR
EQUIVALENT
ITEM35 | OVEN & GRILL PK PER 24.28
12/20 CASE
ITEM 36 | LATEX GLOVE PER 32.62
POWDER FREE 15 MIL | CASE

THICK 10/100 CT,
SMALL, MED, LARGE,
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XLARGE EXAM
100/BK LARGE
ITEM 37 GENERAL PERCAS | 41.04.
MAINTENACE DUST E
MOP HEADS 57°X48”
ITEM 38 GENERAL PER 445
MAINTENACE DUST CASE
MOP HEAD 24°X5”
ITEM 39 LATEX GLOVE PER 26.58
POWDER FREE EXAM | CASE 32.50/1000
100/BX SMALL, MED., 32.50/1000 | 32.50/1000 | 32.50/1000 | 32.50/1000
LARGE, XLARGE
BIDDER NAME MONTHLY BID ANNUALLY BID
APC PEST CONTROL 648.00 7,776.00
ROAD INDUSTRIAL MARGIE K&C INDUSTRIAL | BARRIERE DIAMOND B DALEY
MATERIALS | AGGREGATE | AVERETT | GRAVEL MINING CONSTRUCTION | CONSTRUCTION | SAND &
WASHED 10.00 PER NO BID 9.25 PER 11.50 PER NO BID 15.50 PER TON 10.50 PER
GRAVEL TON TON TON TON
HEAVY RED | NOBID $2.50 PER | NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 2.50 PER
CLAY YARD TON
FILL DIRT NO BID NO BID 2.00 PER NO BID NO BID NO BID 1.00 PER
TON TON
SAND $2.00 PER NO BID 2.00 PER 3.00 PER NO BID NO BID 2.50 PER
TON TON TON TON
FOOD ITEM NAME PON FOOD Performance | S&W
Pillsbury unbaked Biscuit dough (priced by case) Pillsbury 38.39 47.30 after 43.79
168/3.170z rebate 40.30
TNT 5.30Z Beef Burger Or comparable (to be price TNT 20Ib 3.26/1b 64.05 2.54/1b
per pound) Master Case
Double D Smoked Sausage (price per box) Double D 31.49 box 31.95 30.83
Riceland Clear Canola Qil /35# Container or Riceland 28.43 25.96 23.17
comparable container
Heinz Ketchup Volume Pack 3 gallons (28.5#) Heinz 24.82 case 23.98 24.32
Frito Corn Chips — Industrial Packs 1# bags 8 per case | Frito Lay 16.59 case 15.72 14.98
(to be priced per case)
French Fries — Crinkle cuts %4” (5# bags) (to be priced 19.30 case 24.28 19.53
per bag)
Parboiled Rice -25#hox Riceland 10.12 box 11.53 9.06
BIDDER NAME TRAFFIC CONTROL EVANGELINE
SPECIALTIES
POST 13 14 gax 10ft 17.85 27.95
ANCHOR 27 12GA X 3FT 9.20 14.25
SMALL CORNER BOLT 5/16” .78 .95
ZINC
FLANGED WASHER NUT 5/16” | .26 INCLUDE IN
ZINC PLATED ABOVE
DRIVE RIVET 3/8” ZINC .89 .56
PLATED
NYLON WASHER 3/8” .26 A3
BARFILED
STEEL SLAG ENTERPRISES
1" OR LESS PER TON F.0.B. YOUR PLANT 1250 PER TON
1" TO 4" PER TON F.0.B. YOUR PLANT 12.50 PER TON
4" TO 8" PER TON F.0.B. YOUR PLANT 12.50 PER TON

A motion was made by Mr. Ridgel and seconded by Mr. Lavine to approve the end of year bids as
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Item No.

Item No.

346708.1

presented. Roll call vote was as follows:

Yeas: 7 (Forrest, Bailey, Bruno, Ridgel, Vial, Lavine, Cortez)
Nays: None

Abstain: None

Absent: 3 (Joseph, Mayeaux, Wells)

Not Voting: None

1j)] Approval of 2017 Section 8 Payment Standards- A motion was made by Mr. Vial and seconded by
Mr. Lavine to approve the 2017 Section 8 payment standards. Roll call vote was as follows:

Yeas: 7 (Forrest, Bailey, Bruno, Ridgel, Vial, Lavine, Cortez)

Nays: None

Abstain: None

Absent: 3 (Joseph, Mayeaux, Wells)

Not Voting: None

9) Financial Report- Presented by Mr. McKneely

9- Adoption of T.P. Ordinance No. 16-65- An ordinance authorizing the Parish President to execute any
and all documents in regards to an agreement with Southern Aggregate, LLC in regards to mine or cause
property to be mined for aggregates at the Tangipahoa Parish Landfill- A motion was made by Mr. Vial and
seconded by Mr. Forrest to adopt T.P. Ordinance No. 16-65. Roll call vote was as follows:
Yeas: 7 (Forrest, Bailey, Bruno, Ridgel, Vial, Lavine, Cortez)
Nays: None
Abstain: None
Absent: 3 (Joseph, Mayeaux, Wells)
Not Voting: None
T.P. Ordinance No. 16-65
AN ORDINANCE AUTHORIZING THE PARISH PRESIDENT TO ENTER INTO A CONTRACTUAL
AGREEMENT WITH SOUTHERN AGGREGATES, LLC
BE IT ORDAINED by the Tangipahoa Parish Council- President Government, governing authority of
Tangipahoa Parish, State of Louisiana, does hereby authorize the Parish President of Tangipahoa Parish, to
enter into a contractual agreement with Southern Aggregates, LLC in regards to mine or cause to property
to be mined for aggregates at the Tangipahoa Parish Landfill.
BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED that this ordinance shall become effective immediately upon signature of
the Parish President and all previous ordinances in conflict with said ordinance are hereby repealed.
The above and foregoing ordinance having been duly submitted to the Tangipahoa Parish Council in
writing; introduced at a public meeting of the Tangipahoa Parish Council; discussed at the said public
hearing; after motion and second was submitted to the official vote of the Tangipahoa Parish Council.
S/Kristen Pecararo, Clerk S/Bobby Cortez, Chairman
Tangipahoa Parish Council Tangipahoa Parish Council
S/Robby Miller, President
Tangipahoa Parish

10- Adoption of T.P. Ordinance No. 16-66- An ordinance placing Closed to Thru Traffic Between
11:30AM & 1:30PM during school hours on Hyatt Road in front of Loranger High School in District No. 4
in Tangipahoa Parish in accordance with Chapter 20, Streets, Roads, Sidewalks and Drainage- Article I, in
General- Section 20-16- A motion was made by Mr. Bruno and seconded by Mr. Bailey to adopt T.P.
Ordinance No. 16-66. Roll call vote was as follows:
Yeas: 7 (Forrest, Bailey, Bruno, Ridgel, Vial, Lavine, Cortez)
Nays: None
Abstain: None
Absent: 3 (Joseph, Mayeaux, Wells)
Not Voting: None
T.P. Ordinance No. 16-66

AN ORDINANCE PLACING A ROAD CLOSED TO THRU TRAFFIC BETWEEN
11:30AM AND 1:30PM DURING SCHOOL HOURS ON HYATT ROAD IN FRONT OF
LORANGER HIGH SCHOOL IN DISTRICT NO. 4 IN TANGIPAHOA PARISH IN
ACCORDANCE WITH CHAPTER 20, STREETS, ROADS, SIDEWALKS AND DRAINAGE -
ARTICLE I, IN GENERAL - SECTION 20-16
BE IT ORDAINED by the Tangipahoa Parish Council, governing authority of Tangipahoa Parish, State of
Louisiana, as follows:
1) A road closed to thru traffic between 11:30AM and 1:30PM during school hours on Hyatt Road in
front of Loranger High School in District No. 4
in Accordance With Chapter 20, Streets, Roads, Sidewalks And Drainage - Article I, in General - Section 20-
16.
BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED that this ordinance shall become effective immediately upon signature of the
Parish President and all previous ordinances in conflict with said ordinance are hereby repealed.
The above and foregoing ordinance having been duly submitted to the Tangipahoa Parish Council in
writing; introduced at a public meeting of the Tangipahoa Parish Council; discussed at the said public
hearing; after motion and second was submitted to the official vote of the Tangipahoa Parish Council.
S/Kristen Pecararo, Clerk S/Bobby Cortez, Chairman
Tangipahoa Parish Council Tangipahoa Parish Council

S/Robby Miller, President
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Tangipahoa Parish

Item No. 21- Beer, Wine, and Liquor Permits- None

Item No. 22- Legal Matters- None

Item No. 23- Councilmen’s Privileges- None

Item No. 24- Adjourn
With no further business appearing, on motion by Mr. Bruno and seconded by Mr. Forrest, the Tangipahoa

Parish Council adjourned.

ATTEST:

S/Kristen Pecararo S/Bobby Cortez

Clerk Chairman

Tangipahoa Parish Council Tangipahoa Parish Council
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